
VOLUME 65, NUMBER 6 PHYSICAL REVIEW LETTERS 6 AUCUST 1990

Harigaya, Wada, and Fesser Reply: In the cases where
the average over the impurities can be done exactly, the
supersymmetric technique gives indeed an exact solution,
as pointed out in the Comment. ' This is the case, for ex-
ample, for the Gaussian and Poisson distributions. The
former corresponds to a Born approximation to the prob-
lem under consideration. We attempted to go beyond
this step, in order to get more reliable information about
the level structure of disordered conjugated polymers.
Since the latter possibility (Poisson ) has come to our at-
tention only recently, we relied upon the conventional
techniques such as coherent-potential approximation
(CPA). Juding from the published results for the Pois-
son distribution, where only the integrated density of
states D(E) g p(e)de has been calculated, we expect a
similar structure in our case; i.e., a density of states,
which is smooth in the Gaussian case, develops more
structure including poles (and consequently steps in the
integrated density of states) in the Poisson case as
demonstrated in Ref. 3. The issue of isolated states
therefore is important, and we believe that our CPA
treatment does give a qualitatively correct answer to this
problem.

To the best of our knowledge, Xu and Trullinger have
adopted the finite-energy cutoff and taken the chemical
potential to be zero, in their numerical calculations of
the order parameter. The finite-energy cutoff violates
the sum rule of the total number of states. It should be
replaced by the constant wave-number cutoff. In addi-
tion, the constant chemical potential results in noncon-

servation of electron number. The chemical potential
has to be determined by the electron-number conserva-
tion. The two conditions must be incorporated in order
to obtain a full self-consistent solution. In our work,
these have been taken into account. Numerical details
will be reported in upcoming publications.

The authors thank T. Ohtsuki for informing them of
Ref. 3.
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